
  
REF. ITEM UNIT OF APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION MEASURE QTY. COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST

1 202 REMOVED, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $4,750.00 $4,750.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $4,100.00 $4,100.00 $2,884.00 $2,884.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $4,850.00 $4,850.00 $1,822.61 $1,822.61 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
2 204 SUBGRADE COMPACTION, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 658 $3.00 $1,974.00 $1.00 $658.00 $1.50 $987.00 $0.50 $329.00 $0.50 $329.00 $2.25 $1,480.50 $0.50 $329.00 $2.50 $1,645.00 $2.00 $1,316.00 $0.49 $322.42 $2.00 $1,316.00 $10.42 $6,856.36
3 304 AGGREGATE BASE, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 216 $35.00 $7,560.00 $21.00 $4,536.00 $23.00 $4,968.00 $28.00 $6,048.00 $28.00 $6,048.00 $32.25 $6,966.00 $22.70 $4,903.20 $14.00 $3,024.00 $34.00 $7,344.00 $34.85 $7,527.60 $32.00 $6,912.00 $66.50 $14,364.00
4 448 ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE,

   TYPE 1, PG 64-22, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 27 $325.00 $8,775.00 $244.00 $6,588.00 $240.00 $6,480.00 $230.00 $6,210.00 $235.00 $6,345.00 $340.00 $9,180.00 $101.46 $2,739.42 $330.00 $8,910.00 $264.00 $7,128.00 $240.61 $6,496.47 $240.00 $6,480.00 $320.00 $8,640.00
5 448 ASPHALT CONCRETE, INTERMEDIATE COURSE,

   TYPE 2, PG 64-22, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 45 $325.00 $14,625.00 $244.00 $10,980.00 $273.00 $12,285.00 $228.00 $10,260.00 $235.00 $10,575.00 $258.00 $11,610.00 $172.27 $7,752.15 $320.00 $14,400.00 $264.00 $11,880.00 $240.56 $10,825.20 $240.00 $10,800.00 $240.00 $10,800.00
6 603 6" PVC SDR-35 SANITARY LATERAL, AS PER PLAN FT. 236 $45.00 $10,620.00 $35.00 $8,260.00 $33.00 $7,788.00 $58.00 $13,688.00 $41.00 $9,676.00 $43.75 $10,325.00 $39.73 $9,376.28 $35.00 $8,260.00 $85.00 $20,060.00 $52.57 $12,406.52 $55.00 $12,980.00 $36.70 $8,661.20
7 603 8" PVC SDR-35 SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN FT. 1123 $55.00 $61,765.00 $23.50 $26,390.50 $25.00 $28,075.00 $30.00 $33,690.00 $30.00 $33,690.00 $39.60 $44,470.80 $32.52 $36,519.96 $45.00 $50,535.00 $31.13 $34,958.99 $30.79 $34,577.17 $45.00 $50,535.00 $49.45 $55,532.35
8 604 TYPE 3 SANITARY MANHOLE AS PER PLAN EACH 3 $5 000 00 $15 000 00 $1 400 00 $4 200 00 $2 600 00 $7 800 00 $1 950 00 $5 850 00 $2 600 00 $7 800 00 $1 800 00 $5 400 00 $2 341 43 $7 024 29 $3 500 00 $10 500 00 $3 272 17 $9 816 51 $2 459 79 $7 379 37 $2 300 00 $6 900 00 $1 400 00 $4 200 00
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8 604 TYPE 3 SANITARY MANHOLE, AS PER PLAN EACH 3 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $1,400.00 $4,200.00 $2,600.00 $7,800.00 $1,950.00 $5,850.00 $2,600.00 $7,800.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00 $2,341.43 $7,024.29 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $3,272.17 $9,816.51 $2,459.79 $7,379.37 $2,300.00 $6,900.00 $1,400.00 $4,200.00
9 614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $830.00 $830.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,855.00 $3,855.00 $9,605.00 $9,605.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $5,800.00 $5,800.00 $7,543.51 $7,543.51 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00
10 623 CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT STAKES, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $550.00 $550.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $1,850.00 $1,850.00 $1,930.00 $1,930.00 $1,541.00 $1,541.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,850.00 $1,850.00 $1,674.75 $1,674.75 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00
11 638 12" DIP CL-52 WATER MAIN, AS PER PLAN FT. 1934 $65.00 $125,710.00 $52.00 $100,568.00 $54.00 $104,436.00 $58.00 $112,172.00 $65.00 $125,710.00 $53.65 $103,759.10 $65.08 $125,864.72 $65.00 $125,710.00 $59.31 $114,705.54 *1 $56.68 $109,619.12 $70.00 $135,380.00 $65.96 $127,566.64
12 638 12" GATE VALVES EACH 3 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $880.00 $2,640.00 $1,925.00 $5,775.00 $1,820.00 $5,460.00 $2,800.00 $8,400.00 $2,020.00 $6,060.00 $2,171.30 $6,513.90 $300.00 $900.00 $1,857.38 $5,572.14 $1,877.64 $5,632.92 $2,200.00 $6,600.00 $1,900.00 $5,700.00
13 638 3/4" COPPER SERVICE BRANCHES, AS PER PLAN FT. 38 $45.00 $1,710.00 $55.00 $2,090.00 $50.00 $1,900.00 $34.00 $1,292.00 $31.00 $1,178.00 $115.00 $4,370.00 $73.98 $2,811.24 $12.00 $456.00 $108.55 $4,124.90 $145.92 $5,544.96 $70.00 $2,660.00 $55.00 $2,090.00
14 638 1" COPPER SERVICE BRANCHES, AS PER PLAN FT. 155 $60.00 $9,300.00 $40.00 $6,200.00 $25.00 $3,875.00 $36.00 $5,580.00 $31.00 $4,805.00 $66.00 $10,230.00 $49.40 $7,657.00 $15.00 $2,325.00 $48.00 $7,440.00 $66.19 $10,259.45 $56.00 $8,680.00 $75.00 $11,625.00
15 638 FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY, AS PER PLAN EACH 6 $3,000.00 $18,000.00 $3,300.00 $19,800.00 $3,605.00 $21,630.00 $3,500.00 $21,000.00 $3,000.00 $18,000.00 $3,485.00 $20,910.00 $4,612.05 $27,672.30 $2,500.00 $15,000.00 $3,899.39 $23,396.34 $3,855.89 $23,135.34 $2,250.00 $13,500.00 $2,600.00 $15,600.00
16 638 FIRE HYDRANT EXTENDED AND ADJUSTED TO GRADE EACH 1 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $500.00 $880.00 $880.00 $850.00 $850.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,685.00 $1,685.00 $540.16 $540.16 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $964.28 $964.28 $1,150.00 $1,150.00 $500.00 $500.00
17 659 SEEDING AND MULCHING, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 5764 $2.00 $11,528.00 $1.50 $8,646.00 $1.50 $8,646.00 $1.00 $5,764.00 $0.75 $4,323.00 $0.80 $4,611.20 $1.55 $8,934.20 $2.00 $11,528.00 $2.00 $11,528.00 $1.31 $7,550.84 $1.50 $8,646.00 $0.50 $2,882.00
18 SPEC. DEWATERING, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $5,480.00 $5,480.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $8,250.00 $8,250.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 NO BID NO BID $25,465.49 $25,465.49 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $37,918.00 $37,918.00
19 SPEC. ASPHALT COLD PATCH, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 77 $200.00 $15,400.00 $215.00 $16,555.00 $245.00 $18,865.00 $205.00 $15,785.00 $250.00 $19,250.00 $254.00 $19,558.00 $233.30 $17,964.10 $110.00 $8,470.00 $408.00 $31,416.00 $337.74 $26,005.98 $200.00 $15,400.00 $250.00 $19,250.00

TOTAL $330,267.00 $225,811.50 $246,000.00 $257,678.00 $268,979.00 $278,750.60 $284,631.92 $289,663.00 $304,686.42 *2 $304,754.00 $304,939.00 $343,685.55

ALTERNATE 1
20 638 12" HDPE, DR-11 WATER MAIN FT. 1934 $65.00 $125,710.00 $61.00 $117,974.00 $62.00 $119,908.00 $73.00 $141,182.00 $70.00 $135,380.00 $68.00 $131,512.00 NO BID NO BID $59.00 $114,106.00 NO BID NO BID $78.47 $151,760.98 $78.50 $151,819.00 NO BID NO BID

ALTERNATE 1 TOTAL

ALTERNATE 2
21 638 12" C-900, DR-18 WATER MAIN FT. 1934 $65.00 $125,710.00 $33.00 $63,822.00 $34.00 $65,756.00 $44.00 $85,096.00 $50.00 $96,700.00 $37.50 $72,525.00 $45.01 $87,049.34 $46.00 $88,964.00 $39.31 $76,025.54 $40.66 $78,636.44 $50.00 $96,700.00 $43.50 $84,129.00

ALTERNATE 2 TOTAL

*1 Total given was $114,705.50.
*2 Total given was $304,686.38.

 
 

 

 


